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Figure 1. Lateral view of left knee. Photo courtesy of Sandi Ma
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A 38-year-old male presented to the Emergency 
Department (ED) after a motorcycle crash. The patient was 
unable to walk because of isolated left knee pain. There were 
multiple abrasions over his left anterior tibia and a deformity 
of the left knee (Figure 1). The patient had very limited range 
of motion of his knee because of pain. His pedal pulses were 
normal bilaterally. The lateral view of the left knee showed a 
posterior knee dislocation (Figure 2). The patient’s knee was 
relocated in the ED, and serial ankle-brachial indices were 
monitored as an inpatient. No angiography was performed. An 
MRI showed significant ligamentous damage, including tears 
of the anterior and posterior cruciate ligament (ACL, PCL) 
and lateral collateral ligament (LCL). The medial collateral 
ligament (MCL) was intact. The patient received an external 
fixator of the knee in the operating room and was discharged 
home with close orthopedics follow up.

Knee dislocations are high-energy injuries. It is supported 
by the ACL and PCL, as well as the MCL and LCL. The 
disruption of all or most of these structures are required in 
knee dislocations. Complications include ligamentous and 
meniscal injuries, in addition to popliteal artery, popliteal 
vein, and peroneal nerve injuries. Concurrent popliteal 

artery injury has been reported to be 10-40%.1 Traditionally 
routine arteriography has been recommended for all patients 
with knee dislocations regardless of a normal distal vascular 
exam, because of the risk of an occult popliteal artery injury 
and thus potential risk for limb amputation. Recently this 
recommendation has been challenged.2 Early studies suggest 
Doppler ultrasonography and serial ankle-brachial indices 
may adequately rule-out arterial injury.3 Management is 
early knee relocation using longitudinal traction and prompt 
orthopedic referral. Arteriography should be performed for 
knee dislocations, suspicious for any popliteal arterial injury.

Figure 2. Plain film lateral view of left knee showing posterior 
knee dislocation
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