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AMERICAN lNDlAN CULTURE A N D  RESEARCH IOURNAL 11:2  (1987) 1-30 

Native Americans and Incorporation: 
Patterns and Problems 

THOMAS D. HALL 

I. INTRODUCTION 

Contact between Native Americans and Europeans first began 
in the late fifteenth and early sixteenth centuries. Since then, so- 
cieties dominated by transplanted Europeans have had complex 
effects on Native American groups, sometimes t y n g  to displace 
or annihilate them, more often trylng to include them in one way 
or another (with varying results), into their respective states. 
These processes and their results have been highly variable. Na- 
tive groups that were once major threats to European invaders 
have all but disappeared, while other groups that were once on 
the verge of annihilation are now among the most prosperous 
of contemporary tribes. Still others have managed to survive and 
preserve much of their cultures. 

How might the myriad patterns of interaction be analyzed? 
One solution is to employ a frame of reference that facilitates 
comparisons of these processes across time and space, and yet 
respects the unique characteristics of each case. This paper sug- 
gests one such possible frame of reference. It is important to note 
at the beginning that what follows is not definitive and complete, 
but suggestive and inchoate. Nevertheless, the examples 
presented illustrate the utility of this approach for re-analyzing 
familiar events, for suggesting new research questions, and for 
indicating directions for further theoretical development. How 
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long this particular frame of reference survives is less important 
than that it serves as a stimulus to developing more refined 
models of European-Native American interactions. 

The goal here is to develop a frame of reference which is use- 
ful throughout the history of Native American interactions with 
European states and which facilitates comparisons of Native 
American histories with histories of native peoples throughout 
the world. Because this period spans the rise and expansion of 
capitalism, the industrial revolution, and the development of the 
modern state, such a frame of reference must be grounded in 
long-term processes of change. 

By focusing on long-term processes, what Braudel has called 
la longue durie, attention to the ordinary scale (l’histoire ivinmen- 
tielle or everyday time) is necessarily attenuated.’ Still, long-term 
processes are the necessary contexts for understanding short- 
term events. This means not only that ”historical context mat- 
ters,” but also that the ways in which historical context matters 
themselves may be part of long-term processes of change. While 
for any one short-term case study the long-term may be treated 
as constant, for comparisons among several short-term studies, 
especially if they span wide gulfs of time or space, the assump- 
tion of long-term constancy is untenable. A frame of reference 
rooted in long-term processes is necessary to make useful com- 
parisons among short-term case studies. 

The frame of reference proposed here builds on the concept of 
incorporation developed in world-system and dependency the- 
ories.* Although that conceptualization is primarily economic, 
world-system and dependency theories are particularly apt start- 
ing points for developing a conceptualization of incorporation 
that encompasses the myriad ways in which Native American so- 
cieties have been incorporated into various European state sys- 
tems. First, these theories are the most developed and 
consistently applied theories of long-term change that specifically 
address the ways in which interactions among societies shape de- 
velopment. Second, they focus on the processes of expansion of 
capitalist states and their consequent contact with formerly ex- 
ternal societies and their incorporation of those societies into an 
evolving ”system.” Third, since these theories focus on the ex- 
pansion of capitalism-broadly construed-they encompass the 
entire history of European-Native American contacts. Fourth, the 
preceding three features provide an explicit basis with which the 
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distinctive process of contact with, and incorporation of, Native 
American societies into European political economy can be com- 
pared with analogous processes throughout the world.3 Fifth, the 
converse of point four, explicitly linking the study of Native 
American-European interaction to existing theories facilitates ex- 
tending knowledge about Native American History beyond 
parochial interests to broader theoretical concerns, thereby im- 
proving general social theory.4 

It is important to note that neither world-system theory nor de- 
pendency theory is the subject under consideration; rather, they 
are foils for conceptual refinement. The major utility of this 
strategy is precisely that it links the study of ways Native Ameri- 
can societies were brought into various European state systems 
with both an extant theoretical body and with analogous 
processes occurring in other times and other places. It is only 
with such an explicit linkage that the study of Native American 
relations with European societies can be used to critique and im- 
prove broader social theory. In short, the point is not world- 
system or dependency theories themselves, but the linkage of the 
study of Native Americans with broad theoretical issues. Indeed, 
a point that emerges in the following discussion is that the 
world-system conceptualization of incorporation is too narrow, 
both in its own terms and in its relative neglect of social, cultural, 
political, and administrative aspects of incorporation. 

The following discussion begins with the dependency and 
world-system theories’ analyses of incorporation, especially as 
those analyses have been applied to Native Americans. Then, be- 
cause incorporation of formerly autonomous groups into state so- 
cieties entails the creation of ”ethnic minorities” and shapes, or 
more often reshapes, ”tribes,” it is useful to discuss briefly the 
terms ”ethnicity” and ”tribe.” The utility of a frame of reference 
based on a broad reconceptualization of incorporation will be il- 
lustrated by historical examples from the American Southwest 
and reinterpretations of a few contemporary studies. 

11. INCORPORATION OF NATIVE AMERICAN GROUPS 

Dependency and world-system theories share a few basic as- 
sumptions: that modern European state expansion was moti- 
vated by the drive for capital accumulation; that new areas or 
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groups were incorporated into a peripheral or colonial relation 
with the incorporating core area; and that such incorporation 
necessarily retarded the development of incorporated areas and 
benefited core areas. These theories tend to underestimate the 
importance of differences in the social organizations of absorbed 
groups. 

The sigruficance of this limitation for the analysis of the process 
of incorporation has been indicated in several studies, although 
the term ”incorporation” typically has not been used in these 
discussions, Wolf criticizes world-system theory by analyzing the 
effects of the expanding capitalist world-economy on indigenous 
groups.5 He demonstrates that local social structure and local ac- 
tions shape the processes of incorporation. Lenski and Nolan 
show that pre-capitalist horticultural societies did not develop 
as readily as pre-capitalist agrarian societies.6 Their analysis ig- 
nores band societies (e.g., Lenski’s hunting and gathering and 
simple horticultural types).7 While this omission is reasonable for 
Lenski and Nolan’s agenda, it is extremely important here since 
a significant proportion of Native American groups were band 
societies aboriginally. Bands were seldom absorbed. Typically, 
they were pushed beyond state frontiers or killed. Furthermore, 
band and horticultural societies do not have ethnic minorities, 
whereas agrarian and industrial states do. Thus, incorporation 
of a band or horticultural society into a state society transforms 
an autonomous group into an ethnic group.* These topics will 
be discussed further below, after a more refined concept of in- 
corporation has been presented. 

Other writers have developed market dependence accounts of 
Native American incorporation. Jorgensen provides some of the 
earliest and most insightful analyses of Native American depen- 
d e n ~ y . ~  He argues that the lack of development, and hence the 
slow ”acculturation” of Native Americans, is due to exploitation 
by the incorporating state. Jacobson modifies the internal colonial 
analysls, arguing that Native American labor was used only spo- 
radically, and then mainly to supplement subsistence activities.*O 
He argues that this was because nineteenth century corporate 
colonialism was interested in Indian lands rather than Indian 
labor. 

Snipp expands the analysis by dividing ”underdevelopment” 
into two phases: (1) a “captive nation’’ phase, in which Native 
American groups have become dependent on the federal govern- 
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ment; and (2) an ”internal colonial” phase in which Native 
American resources are seriously exploited.11 The transition from 
captive nation to internal colony only began during the last 40 
or so years with increasing attempts to expropriate and exploit 
the natural resources on western reservations, particularly energy 
resources. l2 The change from “captive nation” to “internal 
colony” coincides roughly with the industrialization of America 
and its rise from a semi-peripheral to a hegemonic core state dur- 
ing the last century.13 

For the most part these authors discuss band societies in ex- 
istence long after initial contact with Europeans, during 
America’s nineteenth and twentieth century rise as an industrial 
state. Thus, they unintentionally limit the range of variation of 
the type of state doing the incorporating, the types of incorpo- 
rated groups, the extent, and general timing of incorporation. 
This is unfortunate because band societies have few resources of 
interest to industrial or industrializing states, other than land. 
Hence, the seeming cogency of Jacobson’s argument. However, 
in earlier eras labor was more commonly used in the form of cap- 
tives for domestic servants (in the Southwest), for slave labor 
elsewhere in the Spanish empire, and for fur gathering in North 
America.14 A broader frame of reference would help curtail such 
misunderstandings based on unintentional limitations of 
discourse. 

Given these problems, it is useful to reconceptualize incorpo- 
ration as a continuum which ranges from initial contact through 
complete absorption.15 Although the range of incorporation is 
conceptualized as continuous, historical instances of incorpora- 
tion are not necessarily smooth and unidirectional. Indeed, a 
major point of this conceptualization is that incorporation can be 
sporadic and reversible. Change in extent of incorporation is both 
a phenomenon to be explained and the major context of local 
change. Trade andlor geopolitical competition frequently moti- 
vate the initial incorporation of external groups by states. Trade 
relations include such factors as the extent of capital and product 
flows between an expanding state and an incorporated region or 
group, the type of goods exchanged (raw products or manufac- 
tured goods), the degree of centralization of the exchange 
process, and the relative importance of the transfer to each econ- 
omy.16 The causes and consequences of changes in the degree 
of incorporation are major foci of research. 
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Incorporation begins with initial contact between an expand- 
ing state and an external area or group. Just when a formerly au- 
tonomous group becomes an ethnic minority remains a thorny 
theoretical and empirical problem. As a state becomes more in- 
volved in a local region, primary influence generally flows from 
the state to the incorporated area. The completion of incorpora- 
tion remains problematic. World-system and dependency the- 
ories see the process as complete with the “development of 
underdevelopment,”17 but it is equally plausible to argue that the 
logical end of incorporation is total assimilation into the dominant 
group. It is important to note that the flow of influence is asym- 
metrical: core areas have stronger effects on peripheral areas than 
the reverse. While net product and capital flows tend to be 
toward the core, political, social and cultural influences tend to 
flow from the core. 

Several features of this conceptualization of incorporation 
should be highlighted. These are summarized in Diagram 1. First, 
this conceptualization extends the process of incorporation to 
earlier stages than are typically recognized by world-system the- 
ory. Full-scale ”development of underdevelopment” is achieved 
rather late in the incorporation process [see ”World-System Ter- 
minology” in Diagram 21. Second, the early phases of incorpo- 
ration, the transition from ”external arena” to “contact 
periphery” in Diagram 2, are empirically problematic. That is, 
the fuzziness of the beginning of incorporation is real, not an ar- 
tifact of its conceptualization. Third, while incorporation is con- 
ceptualized as a multidimensional continuum, this does not 
mean that the process of incorporation for any given group is a 
continuous, smooth, unidirectional process. Fourth, the labels 
in Diagram 2 are not meant to identity distinct stages, but rather 
to indicate overlapping portions of a continuum. They are used 
to draw parallels and distinctions with analogous concepts, such 
as “Snipp’s Terminology” or World-System Terminology” [see 
Diagram 21 and this conceptualization. Fifth, this conceptualiza- 
tion implies that trajectories or paths of incorporation of specific 
groups should be important subjects for comparative study. 

Two other components of this conceptualization remain un- 
resolved. First, there are other possible end points or conclusions 
of incorporation besides the “development of underdevelop- 
ment” posited by world-system theory. As indicated in Diagram 
1, assimilation or acculturation,18 pluralist accommodation, and 
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CONTINUUM NONE WEAK MODERATE STRONG 

> PLURALIST ACCOM? 
> OTHER??? 

> OTHER??? 
-> REBELLION? 

- . - .-.+ ASSLM. & ACCULT? INCORPORATION< . . 
OF 

M A C T  OF CORE NONE STRONG STRONGER 
ON PERIPHERY 

STRONGEST 

IMPACT OF NONE LOW MODERATE SIGNIFICANT 
PERIPHERY 
ON CORE 

DIAGRAM 1: THE CONCEFT OF INCORPORATION 

CONTINUUMOF NONE WEAK MODERATE STRONG 

INCORPORATION< . . - . - .-. > 

TYPE OF EXTERNAL CONTACT MARGINAL FULL-BLOWN 
PERIPHERY ARENA or REGION or 

OF REFUGE DEPENDENT 

WORLD-SYSTEM NONE EXTERNAL INCORPO- PERIPHERALEATION 
TERMINOLOGY ARENA RATION or 

DEVELOPMENT OF 
UNDERDEVELOPMENT 

SNIPP'S CAlTlVE 
TERMINOLOGY NATION 

INTERNAL 
COLONY 

DIAGRAM 2: COMPARISON OF TERMINOLOGIES FOR DEGREE OF INCORPORATION 
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rebellion are other possible results. The possibilities labeled 
“Other???” indicate that this list is by no means exhaustive, but 
suggestive. Clearly, this raises, but does not answer, some 
thorny theoretical and empirical problems. How many end points 
are there? Are they mutually exclusive, or can they alternate in 
some hierarchical fashion?19 Why does a group arrive at any 
specific end point? Are there patterns or sequences of incorpo- 
ration? Are there any correlations between group characteristics, 
general context and final degree of incorporation? While these 
questions cannot be answered here, it is clear that this concep- 
tualization of incorporation directs attention to such questions. 
The second unresolved issue, closely related to the first, is the 
degree of coupling, or necessary correlation, among economic, 
political, social and cultural aspects of incorporation.20 Due to its 
roots in world-system and dependency theories, this conceptu- 
alization tends to emphasize economic components. While this 
emphasis is maintained here, it is not meant to be deterministic. 
In addition to the problematic coupling of the economic, politi- 
cal, social and cultural components of incorporation, the possi- 
bility must be held open that the coupling-whatever it is-has 
changed as part of other long-term processes.21 

These unresolved problems notwithstanding, this conceptuali- 
zation facilitates consideration of variations in the incorporation 
process, recognizes different motivations for incorporation, fo- 
cuses analysis on the extent of trade and the types of goods ex- 
changed, and draws attention to the interactions between 
incorporated and incorporating groups. Together, these concerns 
form a frame of reference for further study of incorporation. 

It is useful at this point to digress briefly to indicate the differ- 
ences between this concept of incorporation and the concept de- 
veloped by Edward Spicer.22 Spicer compares and contrasts the 
incorporation of Aztec, Yaqui, Puebloan, and Bajio region groups 
into the political structure of New Spain. He emphasizes both the 
diverse strategies of the Viceroys of New Spain and the differ- 
ing effects of political incorporation on indigenous cultures. His 
analysis pays close attention to regional context (how tightly each 
region was integrated into the overall political economy of New 
Spain), but does not attend to shifts in Spanish (and hence in 
New Spain’s) power and position in the global political economy. 
This oversight stems, in part, from his restriction of the analy- 
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sis to the Spanish era (e.g., not following the Puebloan case into 
the American era) and in part from a failure to imbed the analy- 
sis of incorporation in a larger theoretical framework. The frame 
of reference suggested here differs from Spicer's mainly with 
respect to this larger issue, and in its emphasis on political econ- 
omy, as opposed to distinct political and economic spheres. 

In a second essay, Spicer examines a similar problem from the 
opposite angle-the adaptability of different "peoples" to a var- 
iety of cultural  environment^.^^ By a "people" Spicer means: 
' I  . . . a determinable set of human individuals who believe in 
a given set of identity symbols" (p. 796). He distinguishes this 
identity system from the political system so that he can examine 
the relations between the two. Specifically, he focuses on those 
internal characteristics that allow some "peoples" to adapt and 
survive in various cultural environments, noting how participa- 
tion in a state system can have nearly opposite effects on iden- 
tity systems. 

In the terminology developed here, he examines only those 
groups that persisted, but fails to note two important commonal- 
ities that this frame of reference highlights. First, all the groups 
he examines were only marginally incorporated (he does not use 
that term in this essay) into their larger state systems. Second, 
the process of incorporation necessarily entails a transformation 
of each "people" into an "ethnic minority,'' meaning that ex- 
ternal definitions of the group now shape identity. These two 
omissions contain the explanation for the persistence of such 
groups: a refativefy low degree of incorporation allows consider- 
able cultural persistence, but the degree of incorporation cannot 
be explained with solely internal factors. Spicer's analysis lacks 
a linkage between internal characteristics and the larger 
context-precisely the types of factors this frame of reference 
emphasizes. 

At least three sets of factors for further inquiry are implicit in 
the preceding discussion: internal, contextual and interactional. 
Among the internal factors are the pre-contact social organiza- 
tions of the interacting groups. For non-state societies this in- 
cludes degree of and criteria for internal differentiation, mode of 
production, techno-evolutionary development, and so forth. For 
states this includes degree of mercantile vs. capitalist organiza- 
tion, degree of industrialization, and relative position in the 
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world-economy [core or semi-periphery], and direction of change 
in that position [rising, falling, stationary]. Also included in in- 
ternal characteristics of incorporated groups is resource endow- 
ment, and whether the group was cognizant of its resources and 
the pre-contact utility of those resources. Among the contextual 
factors are any supra-societal relations which an incorporated 
group may have with neighboring societies and its own position 
within any such system. For both incorporated and incorporat- 
ing societies, the state of the world-economy is especially salient. 
This includes simple distinctions such as early or late in the rise 
of the “capitalist world-e~onomy,”~~ and more complicated and 
problematic distinctions such as phase of world economy, 
unicentric or multicentric.25 Among the interactional factors are 
the geopolitical location of the incorporated group; whether it is 
on the frontier or entirely contained within the incorporating 
state; the sigruficance of local resources to the incorporating state; 
the relative strengths, military and political, of the two groups; 
and so on. 

These factors are axes along which many different comparisons 
may be made. The theoretical agenda of a specific study will de- 
termine the choice of comparisons to be made. If the theoretical 
purpose is to assess the impact of initial contact on nomadic 
foraging groups, then chronological time or geographical loca- 
tion might be ignored, while careful attention must be given to 
resources sought, the type of state doing the incorporating and 
its position in the world-economy. If, however, one is studying 
changes in the incorporation process itself, then such compari- 
sons would obliterate signtficant differences, and long-term case 
studies of complete trajectories or paths of incorporation would 
be more appropriate. 

Several points should be noted about this frame of reference. 
First, it is not exhaustive. Further research is needed to refine and 
extend the axes of comparison, and probably to add others. 
Second, it explicitly ignores such issues as the mode of produc- 
tion versus dependency theory debate,26 and draws attention in- 
stead to evidence which will contribute to their resolution. The 
use of world-system terminology (e.g., core, periphery, semi- 
periphery) is not an indication of theoretical commitment, but 
rather a heuristic devi~e.~7 Third, the distinctions among inter- 
nal, contextual and interactional factors become blurred once the 
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incorporation process begins. For instance, the significance of 
physical geography-say, plains versus mountains-changes 
with the introduction of new transportation technology-the 
horse-greatly affecting interactions among native groups and 
with Europeans. Fourth, the major utility of this frame of refer- 
ence is in asking questions that have important theoretical im- 
plications, yet are amenable to being answered empirically. It is 
not intended to provide answers based on strictly theoretical 
grounds. Finally, this frame of reference underscores the inter- 
active and dynamic aspects of incorporation, drawing attention to 
the active roles of both incorporated and incorporating groups 
in the process. Furthermore, it raises the possibility that the ways 
in which internal, contextual and interactional factors shape in- 
corporation processes may be changing historically. It is not pos- 
sible to illustrate every conceivable comparison suggested by this 
frame of reference, but a few examples will illustrate the range 
of possibilities. 

Since incorporation can transform an autonomous society into 
an ”ethnic minority,” and frequently reshapes group bound- 
aries, it is useful to elucidate briefly the meanings of the terms 
”ethnicity” and “tribe. ” 

111. AN EXCURSUS ON ETHNICITY AND ”TRIBES” 

While the creation of ”ethnic minorities” has probably occurred 
since the first development of states, “ethnic minorities’’ have 
become more common with the rise and expansion of the Euro- 
pean world-economy and the development of the modern 
nation-state, with its attendant emphasis on citizenship. Hence 
there has been a considerable shift in the empirical referents of 
the term ”ethnicity” over the last half millennium, and conse- 
quently some confusion over the meaning of the term.28 Whereas 
earlier ethnicities centered on what Spicer calls ”peoplehood, ” 
in recent centuries ethnic movements have tended to coalesce 
around “modern” issues such as use of official languages, ac- 
cess to resources, and political access, including voting rights .29 

Over the last several centuries the boundaries between ethnic 
groups have become sharper, even while individuals continue 
to cross them. This is not to deny that the boundaries of modern 
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societies are not also permeable, but to emphasize the clarity of 
modern boundaries and that bureaucratic “tracks” typically ac- 
company such movement.30 Spicer’s attempt to deal with this 
problem, while very insightful, misses the fundamental transfor- 
mation entailed by incorporation: from “people” to ”ethnic 
group.” In particular, the definition of a group is no longer 
solely, or even mainly, a matter of self-identity, but becomes in- 
creasingly subject to external definition. Among other things, this 
means that ethnicity, and ethnic survival, always must be dis- 
cussed in an historical and supra-regional context and that both 
are profoundly affected by processes of incorporation. 

There are analogous problems with the term “tribe.” Many 
“tribes,” especially simpler ones, exist mainly in the eyes of the 
beholder, and not for the members. What are frequently labeled 
”tribes” or even ”nations” are in fact collections of bands that 
share linguistic similarity, and which interact oc~asionally.~* Such 
labels are generated in the contact phase and early phases of in- 
corporation because states-characteristically having some form 
of bureaucratic structure-have great difficulty interacting with 
societies that do not have a formal political structure. Fried ar- 
gues that ”tribes” are almost always produced by an amalgama- 
tion of related bands, or the fragmentation of a chiefdom as a 
consequence of interaction with more complex societies .32 In 
short, ”tribes” typically are produced by incorporation, or oc- 
casionally, its failure. 

It is now appropriate to flesh out this abstract discussion by 
turning to some specific illustrations. 

IV. SOUTHWESTERN EXAMPLES33 

Spain, Great Britain, Portugal and the United States have had 
different impacts on Native American groups.34 Changes in the 
positions of those nation-states in the world-economy led to var- 
iations in the effects of incorporation. As Spain fell, its effects 
there decreased, and as America rose, its effects there increased. 
Such effects are illustrated in a brief history of the people now 
known as the Navajos.35 

Athapaskan speakers arrived in the American Southwest some 
time before the Spaniards. During the course of several centu- 
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ries of interaction with Spanish settlers and officials, the various 
Athapaskan "tribes" (Navajo, along with several Apache groups) 
were formed. During the Spanish era Navajos adapted many 
Hispanic customs and technologies to their own culture: the 
horse, sheep herding, wool weaving, etc. After the American 
conquest (1848), the Navajos were forced onto a reservation 
(1864-1868). The arrival of the railroads in the 1880s introduced 
Navajos to wage labor. In the twentieth century urban relocation 
programs induced some Navajos to leave the reservation, and in- 
tensive use of reservation resources began. 

The nature of Navajo society changed over the centuries of con- 
tact. At initial contact, Navajos were organized in several more 
or less autonomous bands, independent both from Spaniards 
and from each other. As they became even marginally incorpo- 
rated into the Spanish empire through trading and raiding 
(Navajos raided Spaniards for horses, sheep and other goods; 
Spaniards raided Navajos for slaves and later sheep) they gradu- 
ally became a more cohesive group. In the reservation era they 
became a distinct, encapsulated group. In the twentieth century 
they have become subject to increasing internal colonial exploi- 
tation, and are now an "ethnic minority," politically encapsu- 
lated within a larger state. 

These changes in Navajo social organization have been as- 
sociated with incorporation into the Spanish, Mexican, and 
American states. This example simplifies the ethnic survival is- 
sue because historical continuity permits continued identification 
of the group, even while its very nature is changing. However, 
it makes disentangling the combined effects of state strength, po- 
sition in the world-economy and timing of incorporation difficult 
since these factors were different for each of the incorporating 
states. During the Spanish, Mexican and early American eras 
Navajos lived on the fringes of state control. For the first sixty 
years of the American era they were part of territories rather than 
states, which indicates a generally moderate degree of in- 
corporation. 

In the Spanish era, interaction was primarily through raiding: 
Navajo captives were "exchanged" for Spanish horses and 
sheep. Navajo captives were used for household labor and oc- 
casionally sent to the silver mines in north central New Spain.36 
Spanish horses and sheep were the major items taken by 
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Navajos. Later, after the Indians had amassed their own herds, 
sheep were taken from Navajos, and trading alternated with raid- 
ing. Gradually, land became more important than labor, espe- 
cially when enslavement of captives was eliminated after the 
American Civil War (1860-1864). In the twentieth century there 
was increasing, but still sporadic, use of Navajo labor. 

After World War I1 the increasing importance and exploitation 
of Navajo mineral resources had dramatic effects on the lives of 
Navajos37 and even led to hostilities between Navajos and Hopis 
in a dispute over the ownership of Black Mesa and its extensive 
coal deposits.3H These twentieth-century changes were paralleled 
by increasingly strong attempts to assimilate and acculturate 
Navajos. At first this was the work of traders and missionaries. 
Later it became the work of the Bureau of Indian Affairs, and fi- 
nally of the Navajo Tribe itself.39 Even now, well after their reser- 
vation was formally defined, they are still not fully incorporated 
into the American state. 

Thus, it is clear that both the relatively mild degree of incor- 
poration and the relatively small changes in the degree of incor- 
poration have had important consequences for Native American 
groups. Incidentally, too, this example sheds light on the rela- 
tively recent (i. e., within the last twenty years or so) interest in 
internal colonial and dependency models of the Native Ameri- 
can situation. For the most part it has been only since World War 
I1 that the incorporation of Native American groups has ap- 
proached the “development of underdevelopment” level of in- 
tensity of incorporation. It was at this time that these models 
became increasingly common, due to the combination of Ameri- 
can industrial development, technological change, and the 
presence on many western reservations of now valuable but 
previously unknown or undervalued resources, such as coal, oil 
and uranium. The flare-up of the Navajo-Hopi land dispute also 
illustrates how the degree of incorporation can affect relations be- 
tween Native American groups. 

The effects of changes in intensity of incorporation on ethnic- 
ity are illustrated in the creation and destruction of two distinc- 
tive ethnic niches in the Southwest. First, during most of the 
Spanish period there was extensive trade in captives or slaves. 
Many Native American slaves who as children were adopted into 
Hispanic families lived in separate communities as adults. These 
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people became known as “Genizuro~.”~~ The elimination of In- 
dian slavery in the years following the American Civil War 
(1860-1864) destroyed this niche, and the Genz‘zuros disappeared 
into the Hispanic population. Second, while the Spaniards main- 
tained peaceful relations with Comanche bands (after cu. 1786), 
trade between the sedentary New Mexican population and 
Comanche nomads took place on a regular basis. A group of 
traders known as “comancheros” formed from lower class 
Hispanic settlers and some Pueblo Indians.4’ After the American 
conquest, Comanches became enemies of the (American) state, 
and this trade became illegal and was eliminated as the 
Comanches were ”pacified” and forced onto a reservation. The 
comanchero niche was destroyed and the comancheros also dis- 
appeared into Hispanic society. These examples illustrate how 
changes in intensity of incorporation of a region into a state so- 
ciety can shape local ethnic processes. The changing nature of 
Genizaro, comanchero and Navajo ethnicity illustrates the sig- 
nificance of the transfer of control of the region from Spain to 
America for Southwestern ethnic relations. 

A more complex comparison of the trajectories of change of 
Comanche and Apache bands under both Spain and the U.S. re- 
fines the preceding examples. Under Spain the Comanche bands 
became more centralized and the Apache bands became more 
fragmented. This led to Comanche prosperity and Apache 
decline. Under the U.S. these consequences were reversed. For 
the early Spanish period (1598-cu. 1786) New Mexico was in a 
state of endemic warfare with surrounding nomadic groups. The 
taking of captives by Spaniards provoked retaliatory raids, while 
raids on both Spaniards and other nomadic groups were con- 
ducted to gain booty to trade for horses and guns. Beginning in 
1786 New Mexicans formed a lasting peace with Comanche 
bands and induced them to elect a central chief. Thereafter 
Comanches became an effective frontier buffer group and strong 
allies in displacing Apache bands from the south Plains into the 
Basin and Range province of what is now southern Arizona and 
New Mexico. Apache bands became further fragmented as they 
adapted to the highly vaned terrain and continual raiding neces- 
sitated by their geopolitical position amid Spanish and Native 
American enemies. After the American conquest (1848) the ge- 
opolitical positions of these groups were reversed. Comanches 
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became barriers to internal American trade between Texas and 
New Mexico and came to compete with expanding farming and 
cattle ranching in west Texas. Apaches resided in relatively 
empty territory and used the new border with Mexico to their 
own advantage.Q Only with the discovery of useful metals in the 
area were they finally forced onto reservations late in the 
nineteenth century. By that time annihilation was becoming po- 
litically unacceptable as a resolution of Indian relations, although 
it was the favored strategy of local 

What is intriguing here is that two initially similar band soci- 
eties were subjected to pressures from the same states at the 
same time, but with nearly opposite results. There are two in- 
teresting comparisons here: (1) between the effects of different 
states on nomadic bands; and (2) between the effects of the same 
state on two similar collections of bands. These comparisons are 
intelligible because the first holds the social structure of the in- 
corporated groups relatively constant, while varying the type and 
position in the world-economy of the incorporating state. The se- 
cond strategy holds the incorporating state constant, while vary- 
ing the groups incorporated. 

The Pueblo Indians present a contrasting example of social or- 
ganization. They lived in horticultural villages, unrelated lan- 
guages were spoken in different communities, and there was no 
apparent political unity beyond the local village cluster.44 Under 
the initial Spanish administration there was some effort to com- 
bine villages into more compact groups to facilitate administra- 
tion, taxation and defense. Continued raiding, constant and often 
cruel attempts at religious conversion, and heavy demands for 
tribute led to a period of brief unity among the independent 
Pueblo villages, culminating in the Pueblo Revolt in 1680. In 1693, 
when Spaniards reconquered New Mexico, the Pueblo villages 
were granted more autonomy and gradually came to form a sym- 
biotic relationship with Spanish settlers, motivated primarily by 
the need for defensive solidarity against nomadic raiders. After 
the American conquest (1848), this symbiosis disappeared be- 
cause the American state reserved control of nomads to its own 
military, and because that strategy had been very successful. As 
the American West was pacified, Pueblo societies were increas- 
ingly treated like other Native American groups. 

The entire trajectory of Puebloan incorporation into the Span- 



Native Americans and lncorporation 17 

ish empire and Mexico contrasts sharply with that of the various 
nomadic groups, underscoring the significance of aboriginal so- 
cial organization for the incorporation process. Yet, under the 
U.S., they received very little special treatment. This illustrates 
how the significance of aboriginal social organization for incor- 
poration varies with the type of state doing the incorporating. 

These Southwestern examples illustrate how this frame of 
reference can be used to understand many seemingly different 
trajectories of incorporation. It can also be used to reinterpret 
other controversial studies, shedding new light on them. 

V. REINTERPRETATIONS OF OTHER STUDIES 

The first example in this section is very different from the previ- 
ous examples. Instead of following the trajectory of incorpora- 
tion of one group or set of closely-related groups over a long 
period, the author reinterprets the reactions of several groups to 
the Ghost Dance, a social movement which swept through many 
Western Native American groups in the 1870s and the 1 8 9 0 ~ . ~ ~  
Participation in the Ghost Dance has been explained as a 
response to relative andlor absolute depri~ation,~6 to isolation 
and the allotment mo~ement,~’ and to demographic change.48 

Thornton’s demographic analysis of groups participating in the 
Ghost Dance implies that participation was an attempt to resist 
assimilation and a rational response to a recent rapid population 
decline, especially for small groups. That such participation 
helped re-integrate a group, increase its solidarity and regenerate 
its energies, hence contributing to its survival, supports this in- 
terpretation. The Ghost Dance was also “rational” in the sense 
that it was congruent with many Native American concepts of 
cause and effe~t.4~ Revitalization movements, however, have not 
been the only response to incorporation. 

State-building is another response to incorporation. This 
response seems to occur most typically among internally differen- 
tiated groups under specific market c~ndi t ions .~~ State-building, 
usually in the direct interests of that class which was most heavily 
involved in trade with the dominant society, gives a group some 
control over the incorporation process. Thornton has criticized 
Champagne’s equation of state-building with assimilation and 
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notes several other types of movements among the Cher~kee.~’ 
Attention to the internal structure of the incorporated groups 
helps make sense of this debate. For the most part the discussion 
is about different types of societies. The Cherokee and Choctaw 
had more internal differentiation than the Iroquois or the Dela- 
ware, who had been pushed away from horticulture toward in- 
creased hunting by participation in the fur trade.52 Thus, not only 
are the internal structures of the groups different, but those 
differences are to a large extent the consequences of different 
trajectories of past incorporation. 

The association of type of reaction to incorporation (state- 
building versus revitalization movement) with the social struc- 
ture of the incorporated group merits further testing. In this light, 
the existence of revitalization movements among the Cherokee 
noted by Thornton becomes all the more interesting. Were there 
different types of movements, or were they a different response 
to incorporation by a specific portion of Cherokee society? An- 
swers to these questions would shed more light on the interac- 
tion between social organization of indigenous societies and their 
responses to state incorporation. That there apparently is no 
historical record of revitalization movements among the 
Comanche or Apache bands during the Spanish era suggests that 
revitalization movements are not an automatic response to incor- 
poration, or that the nature of the incorporating state shapes the 
response to incorporation. Finally, in regard to the Cherokee, 
there is a distinct possibility that both Champagne’s and Thorn- 
ton’s positions are correct, but only for the particular segments 
and times of Cherokee society each discusses. 

All these studies show that revitalization movements are one- 
way foraging bands which can influence the incorporation 
process. Worsley’s studies of similar movements indicate that 
they may be a general response by band societies to initial incor- 
p ~ r a t i o n . ~ ~  Wuthnow argues that the timing of such movements 
seems to be correlated with various cycles of the world-system.54 
This suggests that the Ghost Dance, and other Native American 
revitalization movements, might be compared with similar move- 
ments in other parts of the world, using the frame of reference 
proposed here to select the axes of comparisons. Global compar- 
isons of revitalization movements would allow some assessment 
of relative importance of contextual factors like phase of the 



Native Americans and Incorporation 19 

world-economy with internal factors like demographic history of 
a group. A working hypothesis at this point would be that the 
specific combination of contextual and internal factors accounts 
for the timing of such movements. However, additional factors 
are needed to account for which specific groups respond to the 
general situation. 

Champagne demonstrates clearly the importance of internal so- 
cial structure, especially value and normative systems and their 
corresponding institutions for the process of incorporation 
(without using that term).55 In particular, he describes how some 
traditional institutions, such as the Tlingit potlatch-moiety, 
Arapahoe ceremonial age grades, and Cherokee village hierarchy 
and principal chieftainship, all were used to develop community- 
wide solidarity. Other groups (e.g., Navajos) who did not have 
such institutions have had some difficulty in building tribal 
solidarity and governmental stability. Champagne’s analysis il- 
lustrates with considerable depth and clarity what this cursory 
summary cannot convey: the importance of the internal social or- 
ganization of an incorporated group for the incorporation 
process. Furthermore, his examples establish that there is not 
simple correlation between societal type (e.g. , band or chiefdom) 
and process of incorporation. Rather, it is the details of internal 
social organization, such as pan-community institutions, that are 
significant. The difference in incorporation processes between 
bands and chiefdoms or between hunter-gatherers and horticul- 
tural societies is probably due to a significant but not perfect 
correlation of the presence of such institutions with general so- 
cietal organization, namely that such institutions are more com- 
mon in horticultural-chiefdom societies. That, however, must 
remain an empirical question. Clearly, though, the analysis of in- 
ternal factors of incorporated groups in the incorporation process 
must go beyond crude sorting and must analyze indigenous in- 
stitutions, including value and normative systems, in detail. 

However, the Navajo example, in the light of this frame of 
reference, suggests that to stress internal normative and value 
systems and to neglect contextual and interactional factors could 
lead to erroneous  conclusion^.^^ Navajo survival is, at least in 
part, due to the combination of external factors (e.g., relatively 
weak attempts at incorporation) and traditional Navajo 
adaptability-an ability to take ideas, processes or goods from 
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others and "Navajoize" them. The Navajo case points to the sig- 
nificance of contextual and interactional factors in the incorpo- 
ration process. The key point here is not the relative importance 
of internal or contextual factors in the incorporation process, but 
the interaction of the two. 

One significant utility of this frame of reference is that it points 
to strategies of comparison which will help disentangle the com- 
plex ways internal, interactional and contextual factors shape in- 
corporation processes. These examples suggest another working 
hypothesis. Namely, the utility and efficacy of internal resources 
for resisting and shaping incorporation vary with the intensity 
of incorporation. Under conditions of relatively mild incorpora- 
tion (e.g. ,  Navajos under Spain) the advantages of fluidity, flex- 
ibility and adaptability of band societies outweigh the rigidities 
of more complex societies. However, when incorporation is, or 
becomes, more intense, flexibility cannot meet the challenge, 
whereas more differentiated social structures can be a basis for 
state formation. Here, again, empirical analyses are needed to re- 
fine and test this hypothesis. 

Two recent analyses emphasize the role of external factors in 
the incorporation process, suggesting that such interaction is it- 
self shaped by the wider geopolitical context in which it occurs. 
In the first, Page argues that recent "pan-tribal" and "pan- 
Indian" movements are a response by Native American groups 
to their peripheral position in American society.57 That is, in the 
terms used here, such movements are a response to attempts to 
increase the incorporation of Native American groups into the 
American political economy. Page uses this analysis to critique 
naive, if well-intentioned, calls for local control, but indicates 
how the very processes of incorporation may give Native Ameri- 
can groups some opportunities both to develop and to maintain 
native cultural identity.s* In terms of this frame of reference, 
Page's analysis interprets changes in the state and changes in the 
world-economy as the context for analyzing Native American 
responses based on their currently available organizational and 
natural resources. Furthermore, her analysis demonstrates that 
only by placing contemporary processes in a broad historical con- 
text can they be properly understood. 

In the second analysis, Cornell argues that there has been a cri- 
sis in Indian-white relations in the last quarter-century or ~ 0 . 5 9  

This crisis represents another round of movement from unilateral 
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to bilateral administration of Native American affairs. This shift 
was engendered by Indian protest activities directed at govern- 
ment agencies (such as the BIA) which posed a threat to the status 
quo in that radical Indians sought to undermine the structure 
rather than simply protest its functioning. This led to a new struc- 
ture that was more bilateral (accepting Indian input) but provided 
more effective social control, regulating Indian affairs (suppos- 
edly) for the benefit of the larger society. A significant aspect of 
this analysis is that it focuses attention on the active role of Na- 
tive Americans in shaping their own destinies. 

This shift can be seen as part of the increasing incorporation 
of Native Americans into the American state. While participation 
in this increasing incorporation has been somewhat voluntary, 
Native Americans have had little control over the conditions of 
participation. They increasingly were forced to choose between 
following a traditional life-style (which, by the twentieth century, 
is itself the product of a long incorporation process) and assimilat- 
ing to the dominant American culture.60 The increasing pressure 
to choose between tradition and assimilation has given rise to 
new responses to incorporation throughout the twentieth cen- 
tury: the National Congress of American Indians (NCAI), Red 
Power, American Indian Movement (AIM), Consortium of 
Energy Resource Tribes (CERT), etc. These movements have be- 
gun to build new and often competing and conflicting foci of Na- 
tive American identity61 and were major initiators of the changes 
analyzed by Cornell. 

Accompanying these pressures for greater assimilation has 
been the creation of new opportunities for Native American en- 
terprises: fishing and canning, sale of cigarettes and liquor, bingo 
and other gambling, and the tourist trade have become impor- 
tant sources of tribal incomes. These changes have also led to 
different processes of incorporation: education, relocation,62 in- 
creasing labor force participation,@ and foster family placement.64 

In the terminology used here, Cornell’s analysis suggests that 
Native American groups have traded increased local autonomy 
for increased incorporation, especially in its economic and cul- 
tural components. Increased participation in the economy re- 
quired Native Americans to follow the American state’s rules for 
economic activity and adhere to its political rules. In return they 
have been granted greater local autonomy and some specific rules 
(e.g., taxes and gambling) have been relaxed for them, creating 
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many of the opportunities for enterprise noted above. In this 
sense they parallel the long-term shifts in ethnicity: boundaries 
are becoming sharper while the content within the boundaries 
is becoming more similar. In short, these are problems associated 
with the transformation from “a people” to “an ethnic group.” 
Here, again, only further research-and in this last case, more 
time-will sort out what is general and what is particular to Na- 
tive Americans in these processes. 

The preceding examples and discussions are far from exhaus- 
tive, but they do illustrate the utility of this frame of reference 
for both reinterpreting existing studies and suggesting new ones. 
It is useful to conclude by summarizing some of the benefits of 
this frame of reference, or other similar ones. 

VI. FINAL COMMENTS 

Some final remarks about the utility of this frame of reference for 
the comparative study of Native Americans are in order. First, 
it is heuristic. Its value is its utility in suggesting productive com- 
parisons. No doubt future studies will add other dimensions of 
comparison. 

Second, it emphasizes that historical setting, local social struc- 
ture, and local conditions are all vital components of incorpora- 
tion. This means more than that history is important qua history. 
It means that historical setting is significant in a theoretical and 
comparative context. Thus, while the social sciences have much 
to contribute to historical studies of ethnicity,65 the converse is 
also true. 

Third, and probably most significant from a research point of 
view, this approach underscores the need to sample broadly 
among instances of incorporation, and facilitates comparisons of 
incorporation of Native Americans with analogous processes 
throughout world history. Only comparisons across the full 
range of types of incorporation can lead to a better understand- 
ing of both the general processes and specific instances of incor- 
poration. Studies are needed which systematically examine 
variations among the factors suggested above. The examination 
of the effects of type of resource used by the incorporating state 
are potentially fruitful. Such studies could include comparisons 
between fishing and canning in the American Northwest, cotton 
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production in the American South, and the fur trade.b6 But 
without systematically placing any such comparative studies in 
a broad context of social, political, and economic change, prolifer- 
ating studies increase rather than decrease confusion. 

Fourth, this approach emphasizes the importance of activities 
and internal dynamics of incorporated groups in the incorpora- 
tion process. Despite concerted attempts in the past two decades 
to re-examine Native American history from a Native American 
point of view,67 Native Americans are still too often seen as vic- 
tims, rather than as active participants in their own histories. 
Focusing on incorporation not only underscores their active role, 
but also highlights the harsh restrictions under which various Na- 
tive American groups acted, underscoring their creative, and 
often heroic, responses to these conditions. 
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